
024-12 5th Avenue North Improvements Due Date: 04/05/12

Unit Cost Subtotal Unit Cost Subtotal Unit Cost Subtotal Unit Cost Subtotal
Paving, Grading & Site Prep
Mobilization $4,045.00 $7,200.00 $7,865.44 No Bid
Jobsite Notification Sign $606.86 $675.00 $617.48 No Bid
Survey Staking and Layout $2,496.93 $2,320.00 $2,108.84 No Bid
Replace Unsuitable Soils $36.16 $1,808.00 $97.00 $4,850.00 $85.57 $4,278.50 No Bid No Bid
Site Prep-Clearing $1.88 $3,572.00 $3.00 $5,700.00 $2.67 $5,073.00 No Bid No Bid
Site Prep-Replace Topsoil $4.20 $6,342.00 $3.50 $5,285.00 $2.45 $3,699.50 No Bid No Bid
6" Limerock Base $4.11 $945.30 $19.10 $4,393.00 $16.84 $3,873.20 No Bid No Bid
4" Limerock Bse $26.51 $1,405.03 $22.00 $1,166.00 $19.48 $1,032.44 No Bid No Bid
12" Stabillised Subgrade $8.38 $2,095.00 $15.60 $3,900.00 $13.74 $3,435.00 No Bid No Bid
Erosion Control $150.00 $340.00 $340.00 $296.39 $296.39 No Bid No Bid
1-1/2" Type S-lll Asphalt $24.81 $5,706.30 $16.75 $3,852.50 $14.76 $3,394.80 No Bid No Bid
Concrete Sidewalk $30.88 $3,705.60 $21.00 $2,520.00 $18.61 $2,233.20 No Bid No Bid
Tyoe "D" curb $13.82 $4,560.00 $15.00 $4,950.00 $12.80 $4,224.00 No Bid No Bid
Maintenance of Traffic $2,250.00 $3,525.00 $3,525.00 $4,053.58 $4,053.58 No Bid No Bid
Finish Grading $2.50 $3,775.00 $2.25 $3,397.50 $2.11 $3,186.10 No Bid No Bid
Paving & Grading Subtotal $43,463.02 $54,074.00 $49,371.47 No Bid No Bid

Landscaping & Irrigation
Trees-East Palatka Holly $175.50 $2,457.00 $145.00 $2,030.00 $166.49 $2,330.86 No Bid No Bid
Shrubs-Flax Lily "var" $8.42 $505.20 $6.40 $384.00 $7.99 $479.40 No Bid No Bid
Shrubs-Green Island Ficus $8.42 $3,115.40 $6.80 $2,516.00 $7.88 $2,915.60 No Bid No Bid
Shrubs-Wax Jasmine $8.42 $522.04 $6.80 $421.60 $7.88 $488.56 No Bid No Bid
Shrubs- Indian Hawthorne $8.42 $4,925.70 $6.80 $3,978.00 $7.88 $4,609.80 No Bid No Bid
Sod- St. Augustine Floritam $0.37 $2,035.00 $0.32 $1,760.00 $0.36 $1,980.00 No Bid No Bid
Mulch-Eucalyptus Gr A $0.46 $4,140.00 $0.39 $3,510.00 $0.43 $3,870.00 No Bid No Bid
Groundcover-Parson's Juniper $8.42 $2,483.90 $6.80 $2,006.00 $7.88 $2,324.60 No Bid No Bid
Irrigation-Valves (1.5") $140.40 $702.00 $120.00 $600.00 $133.19 $665.95 $142.00 $710.00
Irrigation-Spray Heads $17.55 $1,298.70 $15.00 $1,110.00 $16.65 $1,232.10 $26.00 $1,924.00
Irrigation-Rotor Heads $35.69 $2,070.02 $30.40 $1,763.20 $33.85 $1,963.30 $55.00 $3,190.00
Irrigatrion-Mainline $2.52 $1,008.00 $2.15 $860.00 $2.39 $956.00 $3.78 $1,512.00
Offstreet Parking-Crushed Shell $14.92 $298.40 $12.75 $255.00 $14.15 $283.00 No Bid No Bid
Irrigation-Directional Bore $32.76 $1,638.00 $28.00 $1,400.00 $31.08 $1,554.00 $20.00 $1,000.00
Irrigation-Irrigation Sleeves $9.18 $550.80 $7.85 $471.00 $8.71 $522.60 $20.00 $1,200.00
Landscape Items Subtotal $27,750.16 $23,064.80 $26,175.77 $9,536.00

Bid Items Subtotal $71,213.78 $77,138.80 $75,547.24 $9,536.00
Overall Bid Total $71,213.78 $77,138.80 $75,547.24 $9,536.00

Surety Construction Hannula Landscaping Bonness, Inc. Stahlman England Irrigation
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